
AREA DESCRIPTION QTY GCI Impact Ofc Jones-Harrison Office Max

lobby

(vinyl) 6

lobby 912.00$           1,116.90$        949.20$           2,339.94$        

reception

Mesh Seating-Pneumatic Tilter Executive 

Chair w/fixed height molded arms 1

reception 350.00$           106.15$           254.59$           284.99$           

supervisor offices

INT D-TOP PENINSULA DESK W/ HALF 

MODESTY & GMT, 36D X 72W 2

X 42W 2

INT RECTANGULAR DESK W/ HALF MODESTY 

& GMT, 24D X 72W 2

INT LAMINATE MODULAR PEDESTAL, 12/12 2

INT LAMINATE MODULAR PEDESTAL, 6/6/12 2

Mesh Seating-Pneumatic Tilter Executive 

Chair w/fixed height molded arms 2

LIVE STACK CHAIR W/ GLIDES AND ARMS 4

supervisor ofcs 4,058.00$        3,915.00$        2,842.60$        3,905.84$        

conference

BOAT TABLE W/STEEL BASE-FLAT EDGE, 

W/ELEC 48DX120W 1 no bid

Leather (Luxhide*) Seating-Pneumatic Tilter 

Managers Chair w/chrome 10 no bid

INT LAMINATE STORAGE CREDENZA, 2-

DOUBLE DOOR STORAGE CABINETS 1

conference 615.00$           4,510.66$        3,799.08$        6,367.87$        

Meter Svcs

PANELS; CORNER WORKSURFACE 2 

DUPLEXES PER USER, BASE FEED 1 

OVERHEAD BIN, 1 SHELF, 1 BBF PEDESTAL, 1 

FF PEDESTAL 6

BOAT TABLE W/STEEL BASE-FLAT EDGE, NO 

ELEC, 36DX72W 1 no bid

Mesh Seating-Pneumatic Tilter Executive 

Chair w/fixed height molded arms 12

Meter Svcs 27,030.00$      14,457.00$      24,229.37$      18,824.80$      

Std Offices

INT D-TOP PENINSULA DESK W/ HALF 

MODESTY & GMT, 36D X 72W 3 no bid
X 42W 3

INT RECTANGULAR DESK W/ HALF MODESTY 

& GMT, 24D X 72W 3

INT LAMINATE MODULAR PEDESTAL, 12/12 3

INT LAMINATE MODULAR PEDESTAL, 6/6/12 3

INT HUTCH W/LAMINATE NON-LCK DOORS, 

NO PAPR MGT, 14D X 72W X 37H 3

INT RECTANGULAR BOOKCASE, 5-HIGH, 36W 3

Mesh Seating-Pneumatic Tilter Executive 

Chair w/fixed height molded arms 3
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(vinyl) 6

Std Offices 7,932.00$        8,397.03$        5,557.95$        7,067.70$        



AREA DESCRIPTION QTY GCI Impact Ofc Jones-Harrison Office Max

Mapping

PANELS; CORNER WORKSURFACE; 2 

DUPLEXES PER USER, BASE FEED; 1 

OVERHEAD BIN, 1 SHELF, 1 BBF PEDESTAL, 1 

FF PEDESTAL 1

Mesh Seating-Pneumatic Tilter Executive 

Chair w/fixed height molded arms 1

(vinyl) 1

Mapping 4,495.00$        2,540.53$        4,002.79$        2,938.97$        

Line Const

PANELS; CORNER WORKSURFACE; 2 

DUPLEXES PER USER, BASE FEED; 1 

OVERHEAD BIN, 1 SHELF, 1 BBF PEDESTAL, 1 

FF PEDESTAL 10

Mesh Seating-Pneumatic Tilter Executive 

Chair w/fixed height molded arms 10

Line Const 39,570.00$      22,184.40$      37,455.90$      21,349.80$      

Dayroom

ROUND TRAINING TABLE, STD HEIGHT, 

W/GLIDES, 42" DIA 6 no bid

STACK CHAIR, CHROME, NO ARMS (vinyl) 24

CITI-Lounge chair - Fully upholstered w/fixed 

seat and back cushions 6

Dayroom 5,040.00$        6,362.16$        5,611.62$        4,829.82$        

Training RM

INT LAMINATE LECTERN 1 no bid

RECT TRAINING TABLE, FIXED TOP, W/GLIDES, 

NO ELEC, NO GMT, 24DX60W 20 no bid

Mesh Seating-Armless task chair 40

Training RM 7,400.00$        9,726.97$        10,541.60$      18,486.19$      

Inventory Tech

Mesh Seating-Pneumatic Tilter Executive 

Chair w/fixed height molded arms 1

(vinyl) 1

Inventory Tech 502.00$           292.30$           412.79$           674.98$           

206 items

GRAND TOTAL 97,904.00$   73,609.10$   95,657.49$   87,070.90$   

Notes: 

Personal opinion - take a look at actual catalogs (samples if they have them) for Impact & Jones to see if you are 

comparing apples to apples and go from there. Both places can store until needed.

Electric Utilities Maintenance Facility: Office Furniture Needs

Office Max did not submit correctly, they had wrong quantities, missing items and some items that I'm not sure 

are correct. I reworked it to our form, but not 100%. Total would be higher, not lower.
Jones Harrison told me they went with higher end on the 'wood' furniture since it may need to be heavier duty. 

They also said that depending on the layout of the workstations, they could be significantly less (i.e. opposite 

side of panel)

Both Jones & Impact are turn-key. Not sure of others



NOTE: statewide contract pricing on this started at 99,9 



AREA DESCRIPTION QTY Impact Ofc Jones-Harrison

lobby

Live Stack chair w/glides and arms (need some color) 6

lobby 1,116.90$            1,758.00$            

reception

Mesh Seating-Pneumatic Tilter Executive Chair w/fixed height molded arms 1

reception 106.15$               254.59$               

supervisor offices

INT D-TOP PENINSULA DESK W/ HALF MODESTY & GMT, 36D X 72W 2

INT BRIDGE W/ HALF MODESTY & GMT, 24D X 42W 2

INT RECTANGULAR DESK W/ HALF MODESTY & GMT, 24D X 72W 2

INT LAMINATE MODULAR PEDESTAL, 12/12 2

INT LAMINATE MODULAR PEDESTAL, 6/6/12 2

Mesh Seating-Pneumatic Tilter Executive Chair w/fixed height molded arms 2

LIVE STACK CHAIR W/ GLIDES AND ARMS 4

supervisor ofcs 3,761.30$            2,842.60$            

conference

BOAT TABLE W/STEEL BASE-FLAT EDGE, W/ELEC 48DX120W 1

Leather (Luxhide*) Seating-Pneumatic Tilter Managers Chair w/chrome 10

INT LAMINATE STORAGE CREDENZA, 2-DOUBLE DOOR STORAGE CABINETS 1

conference 4,510.66$            3,799.08$            

Meter Svcs

6' X 6' WORKSTATIONS:   62"H MONOLITHIC PANELS; CORNER 

WORKSURFACE 2 DUPLEXES PER USER, BASE FEED 1 OVERHEAD BIN, 1 

SHELF, 1 BBF PEDESTAL, 1 FF PEDESTAL 6

BOAT TABLE W/STEEL BASE-FLAT EDGE, NO ELEC, 36DX72W 1

Mesh Seating-Pneumatic Tilter Executive Chair w/fixed height molded arms 12

Meter Svcs 14,170.74$          17,587.37$          

Std Offices

INT D-TOP PENINSULA DESK W/ HALF MODESTY & GMT, 36D X 72W 3

INT BRIDGE W/ HALF MODESTY & GMT, 24D X 42W 3

INT RECTANGULAR DESK W/ HALF MODESTY & GMT, 24D X 72W 3

INT LAMINATE MODULAR PEDESTAL, 12/12 3

INT LAMINATE MODULAR PEDESTAL, 6/6/12 3

37H 3

INT RECTANGULAR BOOKCASE, 5-HIGH, 36W 3

Mesh Seating-Pneumatic Tilter Executive Chair w/fixed height molded arms 3

LIVE STACK CHAIR W/GLIDES AND ARMS  (vinyl) 6

Std Offices 8,166.48$            5,557.95$            

Mapping

6' X 8' WORKSTATIONS:  62"H MONOLITHIC PANELS; CORNER 

WORKSURFACE; 2 DUPLEXES PER USER, BASE FEED; 1 OVERHEAD BIN, 1 

SHELF, 1 BBF PEDESTAL, 1 FF PEDESTAL 1

Mesh Seating-Pneumatic Tilter Executive Chair w/fixed height molded arms 1

LIVE STACK CHAIR W/GLIDES AND ARMS  (vinyl) 1

2-drawer lateral file 1

2 narrow plain panels 2

Mapping 3,032.57$            4,056.79$            
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AREA DESCRIPTION QTY Impact Ofc Jones-Harrison

Line Const

6' X 6' WORKSTATIONS:  62"H MONOLITHIC PANELS; CORNER 

WORKSURFACE; 2 DUPLEXES PER USER, BASE FEED; 1 OVERHEAD BIN, 1 

SHELF, 1 BBF PEDESTAL, 1 FF PEDESTAL 8

Mesh Seating-Pneumatic Tilter Executive Chair w/fixed height molded arms 8

24DX72W 1

Mesh Seating-Pneumatic Tilter Executive Chair w/fixed height molded arms 6

Line Const 18,512.20$          22,864.55$          

Dayroom

ROUND TRAINING TABLE, STD HEIGHT, W/GLIDES, 42" DIA 6

STACK CHAIR, CHROME, NO ARMS (vinyl) 24

CITI-Lounge chair - Fully upholstered w/fixed seat and back cushions 6

Dayroom 6,362.16$            5,611.62$            

Training RM

INT LAMINATE LECTERN 1

24DX72W 20

Mesh Seating-Armless task chair 40

Training RM 10,827.57$          11,160.80$          

Inventory Tech

Mesh Seating-Pneumatic Tilter Executive Chair w/fixed height molded arms 1

LIVE STACK CHAIR W/ GLIDES AND ARMS (vinyl) 1

Inventory Tech 292.30$               412.79$               
212 items

GRAND TOTAL 70,859.03$       75,906.14$       

*

*

*

* lateral file & narrow panels for the mapping office are INCLUDED in the workstation price.

* no special notes after presentation

initial summary 73,609.10$          95,657.49$          

final summary 70,859.03$          75,906.14$          

difference 2,750.07$            19,751.35$          

Statewide contract pricing - initial

difference between SWC and final prices from local suppliers after 'meeting' 29,127.97$          24,080.86$          

99,987.00

Notes: Impact

there is less difference between Impact's pricing 

since they knew Lance and got floor plans prior to 

pricing

Jones priced free-standing workstations first time

Electric Utilities Maintenance Facility: Office Furniture Needs - FINAL

Notes: Jones

Jones Harrison told me they went with higher end on the 'wood' furniture since it needs to be heavier duty. 

For the training room, the 72" tables will afford your workers the elbow room at only a modest price increase. 

For the reasons noted earlier, my team does not feel that combo units are in your best interest. They would sacrifice file space, 



AREA DESCRIPTION QTY $ EACH $ EXTENDED GROUPING COMMENT

lobby

(vinyl) 6 0.00

lobby -$              

reception

Mesh Seating-Pneumatic Tilter Executive 

Chair w/fixed height molded arms 1 0.00

reception -$              

supervisor offices

INT D-TOP PENINSULA DESK W/ HALF 

MODESTY & GMT, 36D X 72W 2 0.00

X 42W 2 0.00

INT RECTANGULAR DESK W/ HALF MODESTY 

& GMT, 24D X 72W 2 0.00

INT LAMINATE MODULAR PEDESTAL, 12/12 2 0.00

INT LAMINATE MODULAR PEDESTAL, 6/6/12 2 0.00

Mesh Seating-Pneumatic Tilter Executive 

Chair w/fixed height molded arms 2 0.00

LIVE STACK CHAIR W/ GLIDES AND ARMS 4 0.00

supervisor ofcs -$              

conference

BOAT TABLE W/STEEL BASE-FLAT EDGE, 

W/ELEC 48DX120W 1 0.00

Leather (Luxhide*) Seating-Pneumatic Tilter 

Managers Chair w/chrome 10 0.00

INT LAMINATE STORAGE CREDENZA, 2-

DOUBLE DOOR STORAGE CABINETS 1 0.00

conference -$              

Meter Svcs

PANELS; CORNER WORKSURFACE 2 

DUPLEXES PER USER, BASE FEED 1 

OVERHEAD BIN, 1 SHELF, 1 BBF PEDESTAL, 1 

FF PEDESTAL 6 0.00

BOAT TABLE W/STEEL BASE-FLAT EDGE, NO 

ELEC, 36DX72W 1 0.00

Mesh Seating-Pneumatic Tilter Executive 

Chair w/fixed height molded arms 12 0.00

Meter Svcs -$              

Std Offices

INT D-TOP PENINSULA DESK W/ HALF 

MODESTY & GMT, 36D X 72W 3 0.00

X 42W 3 0.00

INT RECTANGULAR DESK W/ HALF MODESTY 

& GMT, 24D X 72W 3 0.00

INT LAMINATE MODULAR PEDESTAL, 12/12 3 0.00

INT LAMINATE MODULAR PEDESTAL, 6/6/12 3 0.00

INT HUTCH W/LAMINATE NON-LCK DOORS, 

NO PAPR MGT, 14D X 72W X 37H 3 0.00

INT RECTANGULAR BOOKCASE, 5-HIGH, 36W 3 0.00

Mesh Seating-Pneumatic Tilter Executive 

Chair w/fixed height molded arms 3 0.00
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(vinyl) 6 0.00

Std Offices -$              



AREA DESCRIPTION QTY $ EACH $ EXTENDED GROUPING COMMENT

Mapping

PANELS; CORNER WORKSURFACE; 2 

DUPLEXES PER USER, BASE FEED; 1 

OVERHEAD BIN, 1 SHELF, 1 BBF PEDESTAL, 1 

FF PEDESTAL 1 0.00

Mesh Seating-Pneumatic Tilter Executive 

Chair w/fixed height molded arms 1 0.00

(vinyl) 1 0.00

Mapping -$              

Line Const

PANELS; CORNER WORKSURFACE; 2 

DUPLEXES PER USER, BASE FEED; 1 

OVERHEAD BIN, 1 SHELF, 1 BBF PEDESTAL, 1 

FF PEDESTAL 10 0.00

Mesh Seating-Pneumatic Tilter Executive 

Chair w/fixed height molded arms 10 0.00

Line Const -$              

Dayroom

ROUND TRAINING TABLE, STD HEIGHT, 

W/GLIDES, 42" DIA 6 0.00

STACK CHAIR, CHROME, NO ARMS (vinyl) 24 0.00

CITI-Lounge chair - Fully upholstered w/fixed 

seat and back cushions 6 0.00

Dayroom -$              

Training RM

INT LAMINATE LECTERN 1 0.00

RECT TRAINING TABLE, FIXED TOP, W/GLIDES, 

NO ELEC, NO GMT, 24DX60W 20 0.00

Mesh Seating-Armless task chair 40 0.00

Training RM -$              

Inventory Tech

Mesh Seating-Pneumatic Tilter Executive 

Chair w/fixed height molded arms 1 0.00

(vinyl) 1 0.00

206 items Inventory Tech -$              

-$            GRAND TOTAL
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#

18

24

30

40

10

6

1

1

20

6

16

1

5

5

5

5

5

3

3

1

1

ADDITIONAL COMMENTS:

Electric Utilities Maintenance Facility: Office Furniture Needs

ITEM SUMMARY FOR INFORMATIONAL PURPOSES 

INT HUTCH W/LAMINATE NON-LCK DOORS, NO PAPR MGT, 14D X 72W X 37H

INT RECTANGULAR BOOKCASE, 5-HIGH, 36W

INT LAMINATE STORAGE CREDENZA, 2-DOUBLE DOOR STORAGE CABINETS

INT LAMINATE LECTERN

6' X 8' WORKSTATIONS:  62"H MONOLITHIC PANELS; CORNER WORKSURFACE, 2 DUPLEXES PER USER, BASE FEED, 1 OVERHEAD BIN, 1 

SHELF, 1 BBF PEDESTAL, 1 FF PEDESTAL

INT D-TOP PENINSULA DESK W/ HALF MODESTY & GMT, 36D X 72W

INT BRIDGE W/ HALF MODESTY & GMT, 24D X 42W

INT RECTANGULAR DESK W/ HALF MODESTY & GMT, 24D X 72W

INT LAMINATE MODULAR PEDESTAL, 12/12

INT LAMINATE MODULAR PEDESTAL, 6/6/12

CITI-Lounge chair - Fully upholstered w/fixed seat and back cushions

BOAT TABLE W/STEEL BASE-FLAT EDGE, W/ELEC 48DX120W

BOAT TABLE W/STEEL BASE-FLAT EDGE, NO ELEC, 36DX72W

RECT TRAINING TABLE, FIXED TOP, W/GLIDES, NO ELEC, NO GMT, 24DX60W

ROUND TRAINING TABLE, STD HEIGHT, W/GLIDES, 42" DIA

6' X 6' WORKSTATIONS:   62"H MONOLITHIC PANELS; CORNER WORKSURFACE 2 DUPLEXES PER USER, BASE FEED, 1 OVERHEAD BIN, 1 

SHELF, 1 BBF PEDESTAL, 1 FF PEDESTAL

LIVE STACK CHAIR W/ GLIDES AND ARMS

STACK CHAIR, CHROME, NO ARMS

Mesh Seating-Pneumatic Tilter Executive Chair w/fixed height molded arms

Mesh Seating-Armless task chair

Leather (Luxhide*) Seating-Pneumatic Tilter Managers Chair w/chrome



SUBMITTED BY: 

COMPANY AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE


